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BELONG
What qualities do you think are most important in a 
leader? Why?  

GROW
Read 1 Thessalonians 2:1-12. Step through these 
verses and identify ways in which Paul (and others 
with him) shared the Gospel and taught the people 
in Thessalonica about the Lord. Notice the mindset, 
motivation, how they treated the people, and what 
they sought to teach.

What can you learn from Paul about effective 
Christian training (discipleship)? Have you 
experienced a Gospel-centered leadership like this 
before? How did it impact those under and around 
the leader? 

How could you apply more of the servant-based 
leadership qualities that Paul demonstrates in all 
areas of your life? Where and how could you put 
them into practice? 

How could you seek to intentionally grow as a 
spiritual leader? Who could help guide or train you 
in some way? 

Going Deeper: The word “Gospel” is a key word 
that Paul uses four times in 1 Thessalonians. 
“Gospel” literally means “good news.” Read 1 
Corinthians 15:1-7 and see how Paul clearly 
defines “Gospel” for us. How would you state the 
Gospel and in your own words to a friend?

How has this passage challenged you? How has it 
helped you to understand Christian leadership and 
the Gospel more clearly?

C L A R I T Y 
discussion guide

https://www.biblegateway.com/passage/?search=1+Thessalonians+2%3A1-12&version=NIV
https://www.biblegateway.com/passage/?search=1+Corinthians+15%3A1-7&version=NIV
https://www.biblegateway.com/passage/?search=1+Corinthians+15%3A1-7&version=NIV


serve

Pray for our future global workers that God will continue 
to guide them and prepare their hearts to do His work.   

pray

The Salvation Army
The Salvation Army is a great place to serve your 
community. Volunteer opportunities include food 
pantry opportunities, serving a meal, and assisting 
in the thrift store. This is a great opportunity for 
a family or a group to serve together here in our 
own town. For more information and to sign up, 
click here.
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